SCHOOL BOARD OF ALACHUA COUNTY, FLORIDA

BID TABULATION POSTED: JUNE 4,2025, AT 4:00 PM (EDST)
BID: IFB 25-41

BID TITLE: CHARTER BUS SERVICES

BID DATE AND TIME DUE: MAY 22,2025 AT 3:00 PM (EDST)

Benchmark MCA . Phoenix Bus A Candies BTM Coaches Lamers Bus Pico Bros Motor it Busdihes

Basis for Award Coachlines Transportation Coachworks Lines, Inc Coaches

. Offc.rs the scope o(‘servicgs as described herein that meet the specific needs and Ves Yes Yes N Yes Vg Yes Yes
quali ndards of the District:
Demonstrates the greatest benefit to the District as it pertains to capacity, experience,
expertise, past performance, safety, and financial stability in accomplishing the scope Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
of services described herein:
Provides the level of service required by District in regards to:
Depth, size and operating condition of vehicle fleet, including available amenities; Yes Yes Yes Yes Vs Vi Yes Yes
Number and qualifications of drivers and other personnel available under this Yes Yes Ves Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
contract;
Opeal'ational support including driver safety training and vehicle maintenance Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
services:

. [Offers compe-titive sgr}fice r.ate.s that lresult in favorable pricing Fo the District. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
(Proposed ceiling pricing within a fair and reasonalbe competitive range)
Accepts the District's Visa Purchasing Card and official District purchase orders; Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Vi Yes
Accepts and complies with all terms and conditions of this IFB; Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Recommend Award: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

DOT and FMCSA Compliance:
Department of Transportation # (DOT#): 4222606 1249279 1882749 1515652 3077114 100115 3114569 223283
Department of Transportation Safety Rating: Satisfactory Satisfactory Satisfactory Satisfactory Satisfactory Satisfactory Satisfactory Satisfactory
Operating Authority (MC #): MC-1632365 MC - 533107 MC - 678853 MC-567570 MC-64539 MC - 146955 MC-1572437 MC - 141499
Submittals Checklist
Bidder Acknowledgement and Acceptance Form: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Debarment Form: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Jessica Lunsford Act Form: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Small/Minority Business Enterprise Form: Yes N/A Yes N/A N/A N/A Yes N/A
Insurance Certification Form: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attachment C - Form of Proposal: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Questionnaire: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
References: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bus Fleet Inventory List: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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Price Bid: Reference Attachment C, Form of Proposal

NR = Non-Responsive

RATE CLASSIFICATION A B C D
BIDDER # PASSENG 20-29 30-47 48-55 Other Sizes
A-1_|5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service $745.00 No Bid $1.275.00 No Bid
B-2 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) $145.00 + $195.00 '
T B-3 Trips_ 5-10 Hours: Milgage Rate (flat fee per mile) $6.50 + $8.50 +
Coachlines C-4 Mult!ple Days or Ovem!ght Stay: Rgte Per Day ‘ $1,495.00 + $2.225.00 +
C-5_|Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $6.50 ’ $8.50 v
D-6_[Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days $165.00 ' $225.00 +
E-7_|Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation $100.00 v $100.00 M
A-1_|5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service No Bid No Bid $1,550.00 No Bid
B-2 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) + + $200.00 +
MCA B-3 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) + + $20.00 v
T —— C-4_[Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day ‘ + + $2.500.00 +
C-5_|Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) + + $20.00 +
D-6_|Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days + + $300.00 +
E-7 |Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation + v $100.00 b
A-1_|5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service $1.750.00 $1.750.00 $1,750.00 $1.750.00
B-2 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) $160.00 $160.00 $160.00 $160.00
B-3 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00
Phoenix Bus C-4_|Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day $2.500.00 $2.500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00,
C-5 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00
D-6 [Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00
E-7_[Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
A-1 {5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service $2.500.00 No Bid $2.500.00 No Bid
B-2 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) $500.00 + $500.00 +
. B-3 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $10.00 + $10.00 k
Cizii:i;:]is C-4 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day $2,500.00 + $2,500.00 +
C-5 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $10.00 + $10.00 +
D-6 [Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days $500.00 + $500.00 +
E-7 |Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation $100.00 + $100.00 +
A-1_|5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service $1.200.00 $1.500.00 $1,700.00 $2.100.00
B-2 [Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) $200.00 $250.00 $250.00 $300.00
B-3 |[Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $6.00 $7.00 $7.00 $8.00
BTM Coaches | C-4 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day $1,500.00 $1,700.00 $1,800.00 $2,600.00,
C-5_|Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $6.00 $7.00 $7.00 $8.00
D-6_|Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days $3,000.00 $3,400.00 $3,600.00 $5,200.00
E-7 |Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation $100.00) $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
A-1 |5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service No Bid $941.00 $1,046.00 No Bid
B-2 [Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) + No Bid No Bid +
Lamers Bus Lines B-3 [Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) \ No Bid No Bid 13
Tiic | C-4 [Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day v $1,600.00 $2,000.00 +
C-5 [Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) + $5.75 $7.75 4
D-6 [Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days + $210.00 $245.00 4
E-7 |Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation + $100.00 $100.00 +
A-1 |5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 No Bid
B-2 [Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 't
: B-3 |[Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $7.60 $7.60 $7.60 +
Pico Bros. Motor - -
Coaches C-4 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 4
C-5 [Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $7.60 $7.60 $7.60 4
D-6 [Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days $550.00 $550.00 $550.00 +
E-7 [Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 +
A-1 |5 Hour Minimum Trip: Flat Rate for first 5 hours of bus service $3,235.00 $3,235.00 $3,235.00 $3.235.00
B-2 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Rate Per Hour (in addition to 5 hour min. flat rate) $529.00 $529.00 $529.00 $529.00
B-3 |Trips 5 - 10 Hours: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $9.92 $9.92 $9.92 $9.92
Annett Bus Lines | C-4 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Rate Per Day $3,588.00 $3,588.00 $3,588.00 $3,588.00
C-5 |Multiple Days or Overnight Stay: Mileage Rate (flat fee per mile) $11.19 $11.19 $11.19 $11.19
D-6 |Premium Rate per Hour for Designated Days $702.00 $702.00 $702.00 $702.00
E-7 |Flat Fee Rate or Cancellation $100.00! $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
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No. Bidders Solicited: 23

No. Bids Received: 8
No. "No Bid" Received: 1
Comments

Bid Recommendation

At the next regularly scheduled meeting of the School Board of Alachua County, Florida, the Purchasing Department
Department shall recommend that a contract for Charter Bus Services be awarded to the following low,
responsive and responsible Bidders:

Benchmark Coachlines
MCA Transportation
Phoenix Bus

A Candies Coachworks
BTM Coaches

Lamers Bus Lines, Inc
Pico Bros Motor Coaches
Annett Bus Lines

Tabulated By: é ZZ;:/( Reviewed By: km

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in F.S. 120.54(3) shall constitute a waiver of proceeding under
Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.
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